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From: Staton, Jennifer A
Sent: Wednesday, August 8, 2018 8:15 AM
To: 'fran bisi'
Cc: Foster, James H; Crosby, Tonya V
Subject: RE: FOIA
Attachments: SWTS Documentation_Redacted.pdf

Ms. Bisi‐ 
 
Attached is the documentation you requested. 
 
Jennifer Staton, MS, CSP 
Risk Manager 
Beaufort County School District 
843‐322‐2355 (w) | 843‐812‐6405 (m) 
 
‐‐‐‐‐Original Message‐‐‐‐‐ 
From: fran bisi [mailto: ]  
Sent: Friday, August 3, 2018 8:18 AM 
To: Staton, Jennifer A <Jennifer.Staton@beaufort.k12.sc.us> 
Subject: RE: FOIA 
 
Please complete this request with the proper paperwork..original bookkeeper verification,receipt of goods,etc. 
 
 
fran 
 
‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐‐ 
On Wed, 7/25/18, Staton, Jennifer A <Jennifer.Staton@beaufort.k12.sc.us> wrote: 
 
Subject: RE: FOIA 
To: "fran bisi" < > 
Cc: "Foster, James H" <James.Foster@beaufort.k12.sc.us> 
Date: Wednesday, July 25, 2018, 3:08 PM 
 
 Ms. Bisi‐  
   
This purchase was for golf shirts purchased by Auxiliary Services  for the Swinging with the Superintendent 
Golf  Tournament.  The shirts were for tournament sponsors’ team members and also for tournament volunteers.  Funds 
were  reimbursed to the BCSD from proceeds from the  tournament.  
    
 Jennifer Staton, MS, CSP 
Risk Manager 
Beaufort County School District 
843‐322‐2355 (w) | 843‐812‐6405 (m)  
  

   
 From: fran bisi [mailto: ] 
Sent: Wednesday, July 25, 2018 9:53 AM 



To: Staton, Jennifer A <Jennifer.Staton@beaufort.k12.sc.us> 
 
 Subject: FOIA  
  
 Last week when I made a FOIA request for a transaction (see below) through the website it  didn't look like it was 
actually submitted, so I am  following up to make sure you got it.  
   
 Please clarify the Transparency Report in detail as to what "golf  supplies" were purchased and by whom.  
   
 6/27/2017 IN H2 GOLF COMPANY LLC TXN00194464‐ FOR SWTS GOLF TOURNAMENT SUPPLIES‐(P 
CARD) $818.80 10022301‐541000 GENERAL FUND District Office   
   
 thanks  
   
 fran 
 
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  




