From: Amsler, Sandra

Sent: Thursday, November 16, 2017 8:11 AM

To: Kevin Cabual

Cc: Staton, Jennifer A

Subject: RE: Request for Quotes - Audio Equipment - District Educational Support Center (DESC) - 4011206

Good Morning:
Your request is being honored under the Freedom of Information Act. The winning quote for this project was awarded
to Sound Systems and More, Inc.. in the amount of $7,912.84.

Respectfully,

Sandi Amsler, CPPB
Procurement Coordinator
Beaufort County School District
843-322-2349

843-322-0748 (fax)

From: Kevin Cabual [mailto:kevin.cabul@constructionmd.onmicrosoft.com]

Sent: Wednesday, November 15, 2017 9:59 AM

To: Amsler, Sandra <Sandra.Amsler@beaufort.k12.sc.us>

Subject: Re: Request for Quotes - Audio Equipment - District Educational Support Center (DESC) - 4011206

Sandra,

Good morning. I just want to confirm that I received your email yesterday regarding the said project above.
However, I would like to ask also the winning bid amount of the awarded contractor for this project? Thanks

Best Regards,

Darcy "Kevin" Cabul
Bid Research Specialist

xl

30 Technology Parkway South, Suite 100
Norcross, Georgia 30092

Phone: 323.602.5079 ext. 75337
Fax: 866.570.8187

www.ConstructConnect.com

From: Amsler, Sandra <Sandra.Amsler@beaufort.k12.sc.us>
Sent: Tuesday, November 14, 2017 2:39:08 PM




To: Kevin Cabual
Subject: RE: Request for Quotes - Audio Equipment - District Educational Support Center (DESC) - 4011206

This project was awarded to Sound Systems and More. The project should be complete by mid-December.
Sandi

Sandi Amsler, CPPB
Procurement Coordinator
Beaufort County School District
843-322-2349

843-322-0748 (fax)

From: Kevin Cabual [mailto:kevin.cabul@constructionmd.onmicrosoft.com]

Sent: Tuesday, November 14, 2017 2:09 PM

To: Amsler, Sandra <Sandra.Amsler@beaufort.k12.sc.us>

Subject: Request for Quotes - Audio Equipment - District Educational Support Center (DESC) - 4011206

Good Afternoon

I’'m with ConstructConnect. | am writing to request a copy of the bid tabulation for the above mentioned
project and if available the awarded contractor. | would also like to know the anticipated start and end date in
the event that a schedule has been determined.

Thank you for your assistance.

Best Regards,

Darcy "Kevin" Cabul
Bid Research Specialist

xl

30 Technology Parkway South, Suite 100
Norcross, Georgia 30092

Phone: 323.602.5079 ext. 75337
Fax: 866.570.8187

www.ConstructConnect.com




